THE UNITED REPUBLIC OF TANZANIA

In discharge of the functions
No. 60 OF 1966 of the office of the President

| ASSENT,

Second Vice-President

29TH DECEMBER, 1966
An Act to amend the Workmen's Compensation Ordinance

[ ]
ENACTED by the Parliament of the United Republic of Tanzania

1. This Act may be cited as the Workmen's Compensation Ordinance shorttitle,
(Amendment) Act, 1966, shall be read as one with the Workmen's  construction

Compensation Ordinance (hereinafter referred to as "the _Ordinance'?) ﬂ%mence
and shall come into operation on such date as the Minister may, by et

notice in the Gazette, appoint. Cap. 263
2. Section 2 of the Ordinance is hereby amended in subsection (1) by  Provision

deleting the words "sixteen thousand eight hundred" where they occur '@aingto
in the second line of paragraph (@) of the proviso thereto and by application 5 .

substituting therefor the words "twenty-four thousand". a;ended
Definition

3. Section 3 of the Ordinance is hereby amended in subsection (1)  “insurer”

(a) by deleting the definition "insurerand by substituting therefor ~ amended
the following new definition: - addition of
" 'insurer' means any insurance society, company, association or dfinitions
underwriter approved by the Labour Commissioner under MC;”'S‘e'
the provisions of section 25;"; :2” oy of
(b) by adding immediately below the definition "member of the  insurance”
family" the following new definition:'-
" 'the Minister' means the Minister for the time being responsible
for labour matters;";
(c) by inserting immediately below the definition "partial incapacity”
the following new definition: -
"'policy of insurance' includes a cover note;"

4. Section 4 of the Ordinance is hereby amended by inserting immedi-  certain

ately after the words "Ordinance shall" the words and commas ", subject proy{ﬂ'onsl
not to apply

to the provisions of section 25," to
Government

=}



No. 60 Workmen's Compensation Ordinance. (Amendment) 1966

Employer to
beliable

m all

cases of
injury
resulting

in
permanent
partial
incapacity

and
amendment
of the
construction
Of "course of

employment”

Maximum
compen-
sation in
fatal case
increased

Maximum
compern-
sationin
case of
permanent
total
incapacit
incr

5. Section 5 of the Ordinance is hereby amended-

(a) by inserting immediately after the word "injury” in the second
line of paragraph (a) of the proviso to subsection (1) the words
and commas ,0ther than an injury resulting in permanent partial

incapacity, , and
(b) by deleting subsection (2) and substituting therefor the following
new subsection: -

"(2) For the purposes of this Ordinance an accident shall
be deemed to arise out of and in the course of aworkman's
employment-

(a) where death or serious and permanent incapacity of the

workman results from such accident, notwithstanding
that the workman was, at the time when the accident
happened, acting in contravention of any statutory or
other regulation applicable to his employment or of
any orders given by or on behalf of his employer, or
that he was acting without instruction from his emplo-
yer, if such, act was done by the workman for the
purposes of and in connection with his employer's
trade or business; or

(b) where the accident happened in or about any premises

at which the workman was for the time being employed
for the purposes of his employer's trade or business, if
it happened while the workman was taking steps, in an
actual or supposed emergency in or about those
premises, to rescue, succour or protect persons who
were, or were thought to be or likely to be, injured or
imperilled, or to avert or minimise damage to any
property owned by the employer or for which the
employer was answerable to the owner."

6. Section 6 of the Ordinance is hereby amended-

(a) by deleting the words "thirty-six months' earnings or twenty-four
thousand"” where they occur in the third line of paragraph (a)
and substituting therefor the words "forty-one months' earnings
or twenty-nine thousand"; and

(b) by deleting the words "three hundred" in the last line of para-
graph (c) and substituting therefor the words "five hundred".

7. Section 7 of the Ordinance is hereby amended-

() in subsection (1)-

0] bK deleting the words "forty-eight” where they occur m. the
third line and substituting therefor the words "fifty-four™;

and

(i1) by deleting the words "thirty-four, where they occur in the
second line of the proviso and substituting therefor the words
"thirty-eight”; and



No. 60 Workmen's Compensation Ordinance (Amendment) 1966

(b) in subsection (2) by deleting the words "one quarter "where
they occur in the fifth line and substituting therefor the words

"one half ".
8. Section 8 of the Ordinance is hereby amended in subsection (1)  maximum
thereof- compen-
(a) by deleting the words "forty-eight" wheresoever they occur in 3;2’;; "
paragraphs (a) and (b), and substituting therefor the words "fifty- permanent
four"; and partial

incapacity
(b) by deleting the words "thirty-four"” where they occur in the increased
second line of the proviso and substituting therefor the word

thirty-eight"
9. Section 9 of the Ordinance is hereby amended by deleting para- provisions
graph (a) of the proviso to subsection (1). fixing
maximum
amount of
periodical
payment
repealed
10. Section 13 of the Ordinance is hereby amended by del eti nég sub-  Provision
paragraph (i) of paragraph (b) of the proviso and by substituting relating to
therefor the following new subparagraph- - faitreto
"(i) in the case of aworkman whose earnings do not compen-
exceed six hundred shillings per month; or" amended
11. Section 23 of the Ordinance is hereby repealed and replaced by Provisions
by the following new section: — ;S',J‘;;"*

“Remedi 23. (1) Wheretheinjury in respect of which compensa-  workman
agg.'gg '*S " tion is payable under the provisions of this Ordinance was entitledto

. . T . both -
both caused under circumstances creating alegal liability in Some oneation

ion and
employer person other than the employer t6 pay damagesin respect 23’2‘;@';“5‘”
andstranger  thereof, the workman may take proceedings both against  amended

that person to recover such damages and against any person
liable to pay compensation under the provisions of this
Ordinance to recover such compensation, but shall not,
save in the circumstances described in subsection (2), be
entitled to recover both such damages and compensation.

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in subsection (1)-

(a) where aworkman has recovered from any person other
than the employer damages in respect of an injury for
which compensation is payable under the provi-
sions of this Ordinance and the amount of such
damages is | ess than the amount of the compensation
so recoverable, the workman shall be entitled to
recover from the person by whom such compensation
is payable the difference between such two amounts;
and

(b) where aworkman has recovered compensation under
the provisions of this Ordinance in respect of an
injury caused under circumstances creating alegal



4 NO. 60

Workmen's Compensation Ordinance (Amendment) 1966

Cap. 15

liability in some person other than the employer to
pay damages m respect thereof and the amount of
such compensation is less than the amount of the
damages so recoverable from such person, the work-
man shall be entitled to recover from such person the
difference between such two amounts.

(3) If aworkman has recovered compensation under the
provisions of this Ordinance in respect of an injury caused
under circumstances creating alegal liability in some person
other than the employer to pay damages in respect thereof,
the person by whom the compensation was paid, and any
person who has been called on to indemnify another person
under the provisions of section 22 relating to liability in case
of workmen employed by contractors, shall be entitled to be
indemnified as regards the amount of compensation including
costs, by the person so liable to pay damages as aforesaid to
the extent of the amount of the damages for which such
person isliable, and any question of any such indemnity
shall, in default of agreement, be settled by civil suit or, by
consent of the parties, by arbitration under the Arbitration
Ordinance."

Damages to 12. Section 24 of the Ordinance is hereby amended in subsection (1)
abate to thereof by deleting the full stop at the end of paragraph (c) of the

the, extent

of com- proviso thereto, substituting therefor a semi-colon and adding, im-
pensation mediately thereafter, the following new paragraph: -

recovered

"(d) Where compensation for an injury has been paid by
an employer to any person entitled to the same under the
provisions of this Ordinance without such compensation
having been claimed in any proceedings under this Ordinance
and otherwise than pursuant to an agreement come to between
the employer and the workman under the provisions of sub-
section (1) of section 15, the court shall, in any proceed-
ings for recovery of damages for the same injury, take into
account the amount of such compensation so paid in assess-
ing the damages recoverable in such proceedings.”

Compulsory 13. Section 25 of the Ordinance is hereby amended and replaced by

insurance

"Employer
toinsure
ainst
ﬁgabi lity
under the
Ordinance

the following new sections: -

25. (1) Subject to the provisions of subsections (3) and
(4), every employer shall insure and keep himself insured,
with such insurer as may be approved by the Labour Com-
missioner, in respect of any liability which he may incur under
the provisions of this Ordinance to any workman employed
by him.

(2) Any employer who fails to insure or keep himself
insured as required by subsection (1) shall be guilty of an
offence and shall be liable on conviction to afine not exceed-
ing ten thousand shillings or to a term of imprisonment not
exceeding twelve months or to both such fine and imprison-
ment.



No. 60

Workmen's Compensation, Ordinance (Amendment) 1966

5

Certificate

insurance

Certain
conditions
in policies
to be of
no effect

Duty to
surrender
certificate of
insurance on
cancellation

of policy

(3) Nothing in this section shall apply to-
(@) the Government of the United Republic;

(b) the Common Services Organization or any of the self-
contained Services of that Organization;

(c) any city, municipal, town or district council; or

(d) any limited liability company carrying on businessin
Tanganyika and having a paid up share capital of not
less than five hundred thousand shillings, which provides
and maintains by way of security an undertaking by a
surety approved by the Labour Commissioner to make
good, subject to any conditions specified in such under-
taking and up to an amount approved by the L abour
Commissioner, any failure by the company to discharge
any liability which it may incur under the provisions
of this Ordinance to any workman,employed by it:

Provided that any such company as aforesaid shall
remain so exempt from the provisions of this section
for so long only as such security continuesin force.

(4) The Minister may by order in the Gazette exempt any
employer or class of employers from the provisions of this
section.

25A. Whenever an employer insures himself pursuant to
the obligation imposed on him by section 25, the insurer shall,
at the time of the acceptance of the risk, issue and deliver to
the employer a certificate of insurance in the prescribed form.

25B. Where a policy of insurance isissued to an employer
in respect of any liability required to be covered by insurance
under the provisions of section 25 any condition in such policy
providing that no liability shall arise under the policy, or
that any liability so arising shall cease in the event of some
specified thing being done or omitted to be done after the
happening of the event giving rise to a claim under the
policy, shall, as respects such liabilities as are required to be
covered by such policy, be of no effect:

Provided that nothing in this section shall be taken to
render void any provision in such policy requiring the
employer insured to pay to the insurer any sums which the
latter may have become liable to pay under the policy and
which have been applied to the satisfaction of the claims of
workmen employed by the employer.

25c. (1) Where a certificate of insurance has been issued
under the provisions of section 25A to an employer and the

policy is cancelled by mutual consent or by virtue of any

Pr_ovision in the policy, the employer to whom, the certificate
o)

insurance was issued shall, within seven days from the
taking of effect of the cancellation, surrender the certificate of



No. 60

Workmen s Compensation Ordinance (Amendment) 1966

Duty of
insurers to
satisfy
judgment
against
employers

insurance to the insurer or, if it has been lost or destroyed,

make a statutory declaration to that effect and deliver the
same to the insurer.

(2) An employer who contravenes any of the provisions of
this section shall be guilty of an offence and shall be liable on
conviction to afine not exceeding one thousand shillings.

251). (1) If an employer to whom the provisions of section
25 apply isduly insured as required by that section and
judgment in respect of any liability asisrequired to be cove-
red by such insurance is obtained by a workman against the
employer, then, notwithstanding that the insurer may be
entitled to avoid or cancel, or may have avoided of cancelled
the policy of insurance, the insurer shall, subject to the pro-
visions of this section, pay to the workman entitled to the

benefit of the judgment any sum payable thereunder in
respect of the liability including any amount payable in
respect of costs and any sum payable as interest on that
sum by virtue of any law for the time being in forcein
Tanganyikarelating to interest on judgments.

(2) No sum shall be payable by an insurer under the pro-
visions of subsection (1) —

(a) in respect of any judgment, unless before or within
twenty-one days after the commencement of the pro-
ceedings in which the judgment was given, the insurer
had notice of the bringing of the proceedings; or

(b) in respect of any judgment so long as execution there-
on is stayed pending an appeal; or

(c) in connection with any liability, if before the happen-
ing of the accident which was the cause of the injury
giving rise to the liability, the policy of insurance was
cancelled by mutual consent or by virtue of any pro-
vision contained therein and either before the happen-
ing of such accident or after the happening of such
accident, but before the expiration of fourteen days
from the taking effect of the cancellation of the
policy-

(i) the certificate of insurance was surrendered to the

insurer; or

(ii) the employer to whom the certificate of insurance
was issued made a statutory declaration stating that
the certificate of insurance had been lost or destro-
yed; or

(iii) the insurer has commenced proceedings under this
Ordinance in respect of the failure to surrender the
certificate of insurance; or

(d) if, in an action commenced before, or within three
months after, the commencement of the proceedings
in which the judgment was given, the insurer has



No. 60 Workmen's Compensation Ordinance (Amendment) 1966

obtained a declaration from the Court that apart from
any provisions contained in the policy of insurance, he
is entitled to avoid it on the ground that the employer
obtained the insurance by the non-disclosure of a
material fact or a representation of fact which was false
in some material particular, or, if the insurer has
avoided the contract of insurance on that ground, that
he was entitled so to do apart from any provision of
such contract:

Provided that an insurer who has obtained such a
declaration as aforesaid in an action shall not be enti-
tled to the benefit of this paragraph as respects any
judgment obtai ned before the commencement of that
action unless before or within fourteen days after the
commencement of any such action for declaration as
aforesaid he has given notice thereof to the workman
who is the claimant in the said proceedings specifying
the non-disclosure or false representation on which be
proposes to rely, and any person to whom notice of
such action is so given shall be entitled, if he thinks
fit, to be made a party thereto.

(3) If the amount which the insurer becomes liable under
this section to pay in respect of aliability of an employer
insured by a policy exceeds the amount for which he would,
apart from the provisions of this section, be liable under the
policy of insurance in respect of that liability, he shall be
entitled to recover the excess from that employer.

(4) For the avoidance of doubt it is hereby declared that
for the purposes of this section_—

"judgment” includes an order of the court made under the

provisions of subsection (2) of section 15 and also an
order made under section 17; and
"proceedings” includes an application for an order making

an agreement between an employer and aworkman an
order of the court under the provisions of subsection (2)
of section 15 and also an application for review made
under section 17.

(5) Where pursuant to the provisions of this section an
insurer has become liable to satisfy a judgment against an
employer, the insurer may-

(a) where the judgment is an order of the court made under
the provisions of subsection (2) of section 15, make an
application to the court under the provisions of sub-
section (3) of that section; and

(b) where the judgment is an order for a periodical pay-
ment, make an application for review under the pro-
visions of section 17,

asif he were the employer.



No. 60

Workmen's Compensation Ordinance (Amendment) 1966

Employer's
maximum
liability

n "
respect o
medical
expenses
increased

Penalty for
false state-
ments and
wilful
avoidance
policy

Employers
against
whom
claimsare
made to
give
information
asto
insurance

25E. If any, employer, for the purpose of obtaini ng a
policy of insurance as required by section 25 of this Ordi-
nance, makes any false, statement in consequence whereof the

of policy isliable to be avoided, or wilfully does any act which
disentitles him to claim under the policy, he shall be guilty
of an offence and shall be liable on conviction to afine
not exceeding two, thousand shillings or to imprisonment for a
term not exceeding six months, or to both such fine and
imprisonment.

25F,(I) An employer against whom aclaimismadein

respect of any such liability asis required to be covered
by insurance under section 25 shall, on demand being made
by the Labour Commissioner or any person authorized

by him in that behalf, or by or on behalf of the workman
making the claim, state whether he was insured in respect
of that liability, give such particulars respecting the policy
of insurance as the person making the demand may reguire
and produce for inspection by such person the certificate
of insurance.

(2) If, without reasonable excuse, any employer failsto
comply with the provisions of this section, or wilfully makes
any false statement in reply to any such demand as aforesaid,
he shall be guilty of an offence and shall be liable on con-
viction to afine not exceeding one thousand shillings."

14. Section 31 of the Ordinance is hereby amended in subsection (1)

thereof-

(a) by deleting the word "four" where it occurs in paragraph (a) and
substituting therefor the word "six";

(b) by deleting the word "two" where it occursin paragraph (b) and
substituting therefor the word "three"; and

(c) by deleting the words "one thousand" where they occur in para-
graph (c) and substituting therefor the word "one thousand seven
hundred and fifty"

Passed
1966.

in, the National Assembly on the foufteenth day of December,

7

Acting Clerk of the National Assembly

Printed by the Government Printer, Dar es Salaam,



	No_60: 
	1966: 
	No_60_Workmens_Compensati: 
	visions_of_subsection_1: 
	No_60_Workmens_Compensat1: 
	for_the_purposes_of_this: 
	FillText4: 
	Printed_by_the_Govemment: 


